
Roll No.: 1240979001 Sr. No.: 1924419

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SUNAINA CHAUHAN

Son/Daughter of Shri SUNIL CHAUHAN

and Shrimati PARDEEP KAUR

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-354

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979002 Sr. No.: 1924420

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SALONI

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJESH KUMAR

and Shrimati SUNITA  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-115

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 10-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979004 Sr. No.: 1924422

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms TAMANNA

Son/Daughter of Shri RAM KUMAR

and Shrimati PINKI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-355

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979005 Sr. No.: 1924423

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ANANYA GUPTA

Son/Daughter of Shri PANCHAM GUPTA

and Shrimati MINAKSHI GUPTA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-356

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979006 Sr. No.: 1924424

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms VANSH

Son/Daughter of Shri NITIN SIKKA

and Shrimati HARSHA SIKKA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-357

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979007 Sr. No.: 1924425

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ANSHU

Son/Daughter of Shri KRISHAN KUMAR

and Shrimati SUMAN  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-358

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979008 Sr. No.: 1924426

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KOMAL

Son/Daughter of Shri NAND KISHOR

and Shrimati BABY

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-359

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979009 Sr. No.: 1924427

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms MOHIT CHAWLA

Son/Daughter of Shri MUKESH CHAWLA

and Shrimati REKHA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-360

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979010 Sr. No.: 1924428

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms MOHIT

Son/Daughter of Shri KARAN SINGH

and Shrimati POONAM

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-361

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979012 Sr. No.: 1924430

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms HIMANSHI

Son/Daughter of Shri SANJEEV KUMAR SHARMA

and Shrimati ANU

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-362

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979013 Sr. No.: 1924431

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms BHUMI

Son/Daughter of Shri GURJEET

and Shrimati SONIA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-363

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979014 Sr. No.: 1924432

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms NANCY

Son/Daughter of Shri BHUPENDER SINGH

and Shrimati REENA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-364

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979015 Sr. No.: 1924433

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SHRUTI SHARMA

Son/Daughter of Shri GAGAN SHARMA

and Shrimati DIPTI  SHARMA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-365

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979016 Sr. No.: 1924434

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms RAJDEEP TOMAR

Son/Daughter of Shri VISHESH TOMAR

and Shrimati SANGEETA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-366

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979017 Sr. No.: 1924435

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms TANISHA

Son/Daughter of Shri PARVEEN KUMAR

and Shrimati PINKY

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-367

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979018 Sr. No.: 1924436

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms HARSHITA JAIN

Son/Daughter of Shri VIKRAM JAIN

and Shrimati SEEMA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-368

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979019 Sr. No.: 1924437

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms HARSHITA

Son/Daughter of Shri VINOD KUMAR

and Shrimati POOJA RANI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-369

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979020 Sr. No.: 1924438

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ASHISH KUMAR KAMAT

Son/Daughter of Shri SAJAN KAMAT

and Shrimati RADHA DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-370

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979021 Sr. No.: 1924439

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SHIVANI

Son/Daughter of Shri DESHRAJ

and Shrimati SUNITA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-116

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 10-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979022 Sr. No.: 1924440

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SARA CHOUDHARY

Son/Daughter of Shri JASMER SINGH

and Shrimati BEBY

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-GBKL-65

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979023 Sr. No.: 1924441

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KUSHAL GARG

Son/Daughter of Shri ATUL GARG

and Shrimati SONIA  GARG

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-371

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979024 Sr. No.: 1924442

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms GARIMA SINGH

Son/Daughter of Shri DILBAG SINGH

and Shrimati SUMITRA SINGH

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-372

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979025 Sr. No.: 1924443

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms RIDHAM

Son/Daughter of Shri VIJAY GOYAL

and Shrimati RENU GOYAL

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-373

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979026 Sr. No.: 1924444

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SK NOORUDDIN

Son/Daughter of Shri GINNAT ALI

and Shrimati RABIYA  KHATUN

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-374

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979027 Sr. No.: 1924445

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms LAKSHAY

Son/Daughter of Shri PUNEET KUMAR

and Shrimati POONAM

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-375

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979028 Sr. No.: 1924446

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms PRIYA

Son/Daughter of Shri SURENDER

and Shrimati PINKI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-376

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979029 Sr. No.: 1924447

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms MAYANK MANN

Son/Daughter of Shri SURINDER KUMAR

and Shrimati SUSHMA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-1056

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 18-11-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979030 Sr. No.: 1924448

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms TANISHA DAHIYA

Son/Daughter of Shri SATISH KUMAR

and Shrimati SEEMA  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-377

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979031 Sr. No.: 1924449

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms LOKESH JUNEJA

Son/Daughter of Shri SANJAY JUNEJA

and Shrimati RANI  JUNEJA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-378

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979032 Sr. No.: 1924450

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KAPIL JUNEJA

Son/Daughter of Shri SANJAY JUNEJA

and Shrimati RANI  JUNEJA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-379

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979035 Sr. No.: 1924451

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms MEHAKDEEP

Son/Daughter of Shri BHUPINDER SINGH

and Shrimati DAVINDER  KAUR

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-380

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979036 Sr. No.: 1924452

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms RITANSHI

Son/Daughter of Shri NARESH KUMAR

and Shrimati MEENU

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-381

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979037 Sr. No.: 1924453

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms PAAVANDEEP SINGH

Son/Daughter of Shri MOHINDER PAL SINGH

and Shrimati KULVINDER  KAUR

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-382

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979038 Sr. No.: 1924454

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms JAGNOOR SINGH NARANG

Son/Daughter of Shri SATGURPREET SINGH NARANG

and Shrimati USHA NARANG

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-460

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 13-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979039 Sr. No.: 1924455

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms BHAVYA CHAUDHARY

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJAN CHAUDHARY

and Shrimati TUSHAR MANI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-383

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979040 Sr. No.: 1924456

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms LAVISH GROVER

Son/Daughter of Shri ANIL GROVER

and Shrimati MANISHA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-384

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979041 Sr. No.: 1924457

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms DAKSH

Son/Daughter of Shri VISHAL

and Shrimati GEETA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-385

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979042 Sr. No.: 1924458

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ANMOL SINGH

Son/Daughter of Shri KULBEER SINGH

and Shrimati RAJENDER KAUR

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-386

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979043 Sr. No.: 1924459

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms MRIDUL

Son/Daughter of Shri ANUJ GUPTA

and Shrimati SUNITA  GUPTA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-387

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979045 Sr. No.: 1924460

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SURAJ

Son/Daughter of Shri SANJEET KUMAR

and Shrimati BHARTI DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-388

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979046 Sr. No.: 1924461

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms PRINCE

Son/Daughter of Shri BALRAJ KALYAN

and Shrimati NIRMAL KALYAN

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-389

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979047 Sr. No.: 1924462

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KUSH GIRDHAR

Son/Daughter of Shri MUKESH KUMAR

and Shrimati ANJU

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-390

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979048 Sr. No.: 1924463

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KARAN MEHTA

Son/Daughter of Shri AMIT MEHTA

and Shrimati RIYA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-391

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979049 Sr. No.: 1924464

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms BHAVIKA SHARMA

Son/Daughter of Shri YOGESH SHARMA

and Shrimati INDU

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-392

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979050 Sr. No.: 1924465

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms CHIRAG BANSAL

Son/Daughter of Shri ASHOK KUMAR

and Shrimati RANI DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-393

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979051 Sr. No.: 1924466

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KIRAN RANI

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJ KUMAR

and Shrimati JEETO DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-394

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979052 Sr. No.: 1924467

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms TANISHQUA

Son/Daughter of Shri ANKUR VERMA

and Shrimati NISHA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-395

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979053 Sr. No.: 1924468

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms MANISHA

Son/Daughter of Shri DHRAM SINGH

and Shrimati BABY

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-396

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979054 Sr. No.: 1924469

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms JATIN VIJ

Son/Daughter of Shri GUNJAN VIJ

and Shrimati PAYAL VIJ

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-397

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979055 Sr. No.: 1924470

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms HARDIK CHOUDHARY

Son/Daughter of Shri BALWAN SINGH

and Shrimati RENU  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-398

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979056 Sr. No.: 1924471

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms TANIKSHA

Son/Daughter of Shri MULTAN SINGH

and Shrimati SULESH RANI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-399

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979057 Sr. No.: 1924472

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms DEEPANSHU CHOPRA

Son/Daughter of Shri MOHINDER PAL

and Shrimati ASHA RANI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-400

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979059 Sr. No.: 1924474

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms LOVEKESH

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJ KISHAN

and Shrimati SANTOSH

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-117

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 10-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1240979060 Sr. No.: 1941958

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

(A++' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms YUVRAJ PASRICHA

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJ KUMAR

and Shrimati SHEETAL

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 24-DSK-401

Class Bachelor of Commerce (Honours)

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 12-09-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.


