
Roll No.: 1230247001 Sr. No.: 1784248

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms AMAN MANN

Son/Daughter of Shri SURINDER KUMAR

and Shrimati PARMILA RANI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-531

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 13-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247003 Sr. No.: 1784249

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SAWAN SINGH

Son/Daughter of Shri SANJAY

and Shrimati SAVITRI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-532

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 13-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247006 Sr. No.: 1784250

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms MAHAK

Son/Daughter of Shri CHAMEL SINGH

and Shrimati SHIMLA DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 22-PCD-2349

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 13-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247007 Sr. No.: 1784251

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ASHFAK ULLA KHAN

Son/Daughter of Shri NISHAR

and Shrimati MEENA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-1075

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 11-01-2024

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247008 Sr. No.: 1784252

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms RITESH

Son/Daughter of Shri TEJBIR SINGH

and Shrimati BABITA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-533

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 13-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247009 Sr. No.: 1784253

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms DIVYAM MEHLA

Son/Daughter of Shri KRISHAN

and Shrimati SUSHMA  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-534

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 13-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247010 Sr. No.: 1784254

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms TANVI

Son/Daughter of Shri VIRENDER SINGH

and Shrimati MINAXI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-535

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 13-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247011 Sr. No.: 1784255

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ABHISHEK

Son/Daughter of Shri NASIB SINGH

and Shrimati REENA DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 22-DSK-25

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 13-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247012 Sr. No.: 1784256

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms AKANSHI

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJKUMAR

and Shrimati SUMAN

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-536

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 13-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247014 Sr. No.: 1784257

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms HITESH

Son/Daughter of Shri LACHHMAN SINGH

and Shrimati KAMLESH

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-537

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 13-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247015 Sr. No.: 1784258

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms MANJU

Son/Daughter of Shri ISHAM SINGH

and Shrimati VIRMATI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-538

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 13-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247016 Sr. No.: 1784259

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms MUSKAN

Son/Daughter of Shri MUNISH KUMAR

and Shrimati SAVITA  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-539

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 13-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247017 Sr. No.: 1784260

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KABIR DHAMIJA

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJAT DHAMIJA

and Shrimati RUCHI DHAMIJA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-540

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 13-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247018 Sr. No.: 1784261

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms AILISH TAYA

Son/Daughter of Shri VIJAY KUMAR

and Shrimati ANJU DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 21-DSK-930

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 13-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247019 Sr. No.: 1784262

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms JASMIN

Son/Daughter of Shri JAIPAL

and Shrimati USHA  RANI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-541

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247020 Sr. No.: 1784263

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SAFAL KUMAR

Son/Daughter of Shri OM PARKASH

and Shrimati RAJNI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-542

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247021 Sr. No.: 1784264

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms DEVANSHI

Son/Daughter of Shri NAHER SINGH

and Shrimati PINKI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-543

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247023 Sr. No.: 1784265

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms PRACHI CHITTRA

Son/Daughter of Shri SUSHIL KUMAR

and Shrimati SUSHMA DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-544

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247024 Sr. No.: 1784266

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms AYUSH KUMAR

Son/Daughter of Shri RAMESH CHAND

and Shrimati SHEELA DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-545

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247025 Sr. No.: 1784267

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SIMRAN JEET KAUR

Son/Daughter of Shri AMARJEET

and Shrimati RANJEET

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-546

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247026 Sr. No.: 1784268

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms JIYA

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJESH KUMAR

and Shrimati PRIYA MANGLA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-547

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247028 Sr. No.: 1784270

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SRISHTI

Son/Daughter of Shri RITU RAJ

and Shrimati POOJA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-548

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247029 Sr. No.: 1784271

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ROHIT

Son/Daughter of Shri SATVIR

and Shrimati SHEELA  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-549

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247031 Sr. No.: 1784272

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms RICHA

Son/Daughter of Shri SANJAY

and Shrimati KAVITA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-550

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247033 Sr. No.: 1784274

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ANSHIKA

Son/Daughter of Shri MANGAT RAM

and Shrimati NEELAM RANI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-551

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247035 Sr. No.: 1784275

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SANIYA DAHIYA

Son/Daughter of Shri MEHAR SINGH

and Shrimati SUMAN

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-552

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247036 Sr. No.: 1784276

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms MOKSH

Son/Daughter of Shri BRIJMOHAN

and Shrimati SANJU

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-553

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247037 Sr. No.: 1784277

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KANIKA

Son/Daughter of Shri RISHI PAL

and Shrimati BABLI  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-554

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247038 Sr. No.: 1784278

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KHUSHI

Son/Daughter of Shri PARVEEN NARWAL

and Shrimati NISHA RANI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-555

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247039 Sr. No.: 1784279

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms PRIYA

Son/Daughter of Shri JONY RAM

and Shrimati SEEMA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-556

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247041 Sr. No.: 1784280

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SEJAL

Son/Daughter of Shri VIVEK KUMAR

and Shrimati RAJNI BALA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-557

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247042 Sr. No.: 1784281

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ANJALI CHAUHAN

Son/Daughter of Shri ARVIND CHAUHAN

and Shrimati KAVITA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 22-DSK-263

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247044 Sr. No.: 1784282

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms VIDIT GARG

Son/Daughter of Shri RIMPLE KUMAR

and Shrimati RACHNA  MITTAL

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-558

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247048 Sr. No.: 1784283

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms NAVDEEP

Son/Daughter of Shri SUBHASH

and Shrimati PUSHPA DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-559

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247049 Sr. No.: 1784284

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms RAGHAV

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJINDER KUMAR

and Shrimati SUSHMA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-560

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247050 Sr. No.: 1784285

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms CHAHAT CHAUHAN

Son/Daughter of Shri RINKU

and Shrimati MONIKA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-561

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247051 Sr. No.: 1784286

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SAGAR

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJESH KUMAR

and Shrimati USHA  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-562

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247052 Sr. No.: 1784287

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms PRIYANSHU

Son/Daughter of Shri KRISHAN

and Shrimati PROMILA  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-563

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247053 Sr. No.: 1784288

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SHIVAM PUNDIR

Son/Daughter of Shri SANJAY KUMAR PUNDIR

and Shrimati MADHAVI  PUNDIR

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-564

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247054 Sr. No.: 1784289

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KHUSHBOO

Son/Daughter of Shri MR. BALWAN SINGH

and Shrimati NEELAM DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-565

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247055 Sr. No.: 1784290

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms YOG

Son/Daughter of Shri MAHINDER BHATIA

and Shrimati SHEETAL

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-566

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247056 Sr. No.: 1784291

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms MEHAK SAINI

Son/Daughter of Shri ANIL SAINI

and Shrimati INDU

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-567

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247057 Sr. No.: 1784292

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SHAHIN

Son/Daughter of Shri RAFAKAT ALI

and Shrimati AFASANA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-568

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247058 Sr. No.: 1784293

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms TEJVEER SINGH MALLI

Son/Daughter of Shri JARNAIL SINGH MALLI

and Shrimati MANPREET KAUR CHEEMA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-569

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247059 Sr. No.: 1784294

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ANJALI

Son/Daughter of Shri AJAY PAL

and Shrimati SUSHMA  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-570

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247060 Sr. No.: 1784295

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms AYUSH KAMBOJ

Son/Daughter of Shri PANKAJ KUMAR

and Shrimati VINAY KAMBOJ

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-571

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247061 Sr. No.: 1784296

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SAMRIDHI

Son/Daughter of Shri RAM NIWAS

and Shrimati SUBHASH DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-572

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247062 Sr. No.: 1784297

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms VANDANA RANI

Son/Daughter of Shri SOMPAL SINGH

and Shrimati BABITA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 21-GKL-730

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247063 Sr. No.: 1784298

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms MEHAK

Son/Daughter of Shri RAKESH KUMAR

and Shrimati SEEMA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-573

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247064 Sr. No.: 1784299

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms TAMNNA DEVI

Son/Daughter of Shri AMARJEET

and Shrimati LUXMI DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 22-GKL-384

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247065 Sr. No.: 1784300

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms VANSHIKA

Son/Daughter of Shri JAGDISH

and Shrimati NEELAM

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-574

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247066 Sr. No.: 1784301

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KANIKA

Son/Daughter of Shri YOGESH KUMAR

and Shrimati KUSUM

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-575

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247067 Sr. No.: 1784302

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms RAYAN

Son/Daughter of Shri MANOJ SHARMA

and Shrimati RAJNI SHARMA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-576

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247068 Sr. No.: 1784303

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms PARAM

Son/Daughter of Shri DINESH KUMAR

and Shrimati PINKI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-577

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247069 Sr. No.: 1784304

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms NITIN KUMAR

Son/Daughter of Shri SUBHASH CHANDER

and Shrimati REKHA  RANI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-578

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247070 Sr. No.: 1784305

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms VINI SHARMA

Son/Daughter of Shri SANDEEP KUMAR

and Shrimati SUNILA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-579

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247071 Sr. No.: 1784306

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms NANCY SHARMA

Son/Daughter of Shri SHRI RAM

and Shrimati RITU

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-580

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247072 Sr. No.: 1784307

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms PIYUSH KHOKHAR

Son/Daughter of Shri VIKAS KHOKHAR

and Shrimati PREETI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-581

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247073 Sr. No.: 1784308

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms YOGESH CHOPRA

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJIV KUMAR

and Shrimati SUSHMMA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-582

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247074 Sr. No.: 1784309

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SUMIT

Son/Daughter of Shri VIKRAMADITYA

and Shrimati PUSHPANJLI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-583

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247075 Sr. No.: 1784310

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KHUSHI

Son/Daughter of Shri ANIL KUMAR

and Shrimati SHRESTHA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-584

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247076 Sr. No.: 1784311

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms RIZUL

Son/Daughter of Shri SANJEEV KUMAR

and Shrimati REENA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-585

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247077 Sr. No.: 1784312

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ROHIT KUMAR

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJBIR

and Shrimati OM DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-586

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247078 Sr. No.: 1784313

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms MANSI

Son/Daughter of Shri VED PARKASH

and Shrimati BALBIRI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-587

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247079 Sr. No.: 1784314

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms BHAVYA

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJESH KUMAR

and Shrimati RAJNI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-588

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247080 Sr. No.: 1784315

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms MANASVI

Son/Daughter of Shri SANJEEV SHARMA

and Shrimati RENU

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-589

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247081 Sr. No.: 1784316

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KOMAL

Son/Daughter of Shri BAJINDER SINGH

and Shrimati SUMAN DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-590

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247082 Sr. No.: 1784317

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms GURMEET MANDHAN

Son/Daughter of Shri RAMKARAN

and Shrimati SAROJ

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-591

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247083 Sr. No.: 1784318

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms RAJAT PAUL

Son/Daughter of Shri RAMESH KUMAR

and Shrimati KOSHLYA RANI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-592

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247084 Sr. No.: 1784319

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KAMAL SHARMA

Son/Daughter of Shri SUNIL DUTT

and Shrimati SONIA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-593

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247085 Sr. No.: 1784320

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms NIPURN KUMAR

Son/Daughter of Shri ROHIT KUMAR

and Shrimati SUMAN

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-594

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247087 Sr. No.: 1784322

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KHUSHI

Son/Daughter of Shri MAHABIR

and Shrimati RITU DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-595

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247088 Sr. No.: 1784323

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms LATA PANT

Son/Daughter of Shri SURESH PANT

and Shrimati MANJU PANT

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-596

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247089 Sr. No.: 1784324

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms JATIN

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJESH KUMAR

and Shrimati REENA  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-597

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247091 Sr. No.: 1784325

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SWEETY MAAN

Son/Daughter of Shri MR BAJINDER SINGH MAAN

and Shrimati NEELAM

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-598

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247092 Sr. No.: 1784326

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KIRAN DABRA

Son/Daughter of Shri VINOD KUMAR

and Shrimati MEENA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-599

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247093 Sr. No.: 1784327

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KARTIK

Son/Daughter of Shri SUNIL KUMAR

and Shrimati SUMAN  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-600

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247094 Sr. No.: 1784328

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms HARSHUL

Son/Daughter of Shri JASBIR SINGH

and Shrimati SANTOSH DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-601

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247095 Sr. No.: 1784329

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms BHAWNA

Son/Daughter of Shri SHASHI BHUSHAN

and Shrimati NAMITA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-602

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247096 Sr. No.: 1784330

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ARMANPAL

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJINDER KUMAR

and Shrimati REKHA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-603

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247097 Sr. No.: 1784331

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ANSHUL

Son/Daughter of Shri SURENDER

and Shrimati RINKI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-604

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247098 Sr. No.: 1784332

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms RITIKA

Son/Daughter of Shri DALSHER SINGH

and Shrimati POONAM DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-605

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247099 Sr. No.: 1784333

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms RYDHAM

Son/Daughter of Shri BALWINDER SINGH

and Shrimati REKHA  RANI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-606

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247100 Sr. No.: 1784334

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KANIKA

Son/Daughter of Shri SAMOJ KUMAR

and Shrimati NEELAM  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-607

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247101 Sr. No.: 1784335

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms RAMAN SHARMA

Son/Daughter of Shri ROHTASH

and Shrimati SURENDER DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-608

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247102 Sr. No.: 1784336

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SAGAR

Son/Daughter of Shri SATISH

and Shrimati URMILA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-609

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247103 Sr. No.: 1784337

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms RAHUL

Son/Daughter of Shri RAVINDER NAIN

and Shrimati RISHA DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-610

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247104 Sr. No.: 1784338

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms KASHISH

Son/Daughter of Shri SUBHASH  RANA

and Shrimati PINKI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-611

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247105 Sr. No.: 1784339

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ARYAN LOHAN

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJ PAL SINGH

and Shrimati MUKESH RANI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-612

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247106 Sr. No.: 1784340

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms CHETNA

Son/Daughter of Shri PAWAN KUMAR

and Shrimati RITU

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-613

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247107 Sr. No.: 1784341

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms RITU PARASAR

Son/Daughter of Shri KARMBIR PARASAR

and Shrimati NIRMALA  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-614

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247108 Sr. No.: 1784342

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms NISHU

Son/Daughter of Shri SURESH KUMAR

and Shrimati KAVITA  RANI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-615

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247110 Sr. No.: 1784344

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms TANISHA

Son/Daughter of Shri RISHIPAL

and Shrimati SUDESH

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-616

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247111 Sr. No.: 1784345

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms DORIS

Son/Daughter of Shri NARINDER KUMAR

and Shrimati UMA RANI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-617

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247112 Sr. No.: 1784346

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms JANCY

Son/Daughter of Shri SUKHA SINGH

and Shrimati SIMRAN

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-618

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247113 Sr. No.: 1784347

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SHIVANI

Son/Daughter of Shri OM PRAKASH

and Shrimati KAMLESH RANI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-619

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247114 Sr. No.: 1784348

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SANYA

Son/Daughter of Shri DAVINDER KUMAR

and Shrimati MADHU  BALA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-620

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247115 Sr. No.: 1784349

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms MANISH

Son/Daughter of Shri MALKHAN SINGH

and Shrimati SUMAN

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-621

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247116 Sr. No.: 1784350

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms AMANDEEP

Son/Daughter of Shri KULDEEP SINGH

and Shrimati NARESH RANI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-622

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247117 Sr. No.: 1784351

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ANUSHA

Son/Daughter of Shri MUNISH KUMAR

and Shrimati JYOTI  BALA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-623

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247118 Sr. No.: 1784352

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms SWATI

Son/Daughter of Shri PALE RAM

and Shrimati SANTOSH  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-624

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247119 Sr. No.: 1784353

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms BHAVIKA

Son/Daughter of Shri KAMAL CHOPRA

and Shrimati MANJU

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-625

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247120 Sr. No.: 1784354

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms AMAN SHARMA

Son/Daughter of Shri SANJAY

and Shrimati SAVITA DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-626

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247122 Sr. No.: 1784355

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms TUSHTI

Son/Daughter of Shri SHIV KUMAR

and Shrimati SANGEETA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-627

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247123 Sr. No.: 1784356

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ANJALI

Son/Daughter of Shri RAJESH

and Shrimati ASHA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-628

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247124 Sr. No.: 1784357

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms VANSHIKA

Son/Daughter of Shri VIVEK CHAUDHARY

and Shrimati SARITA

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-629

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.



Roll No.: 1230247125 Sr. No.: 1784358

Kurukshetra University
(Established by the State Legislature Act XII of 1956)

('A+' Grade , NAAC Accredited)

STUDENT REGISTRATION CARD

Certified that Mr./Ms ANIKATE PAL

Son/Daughter of Shri NARESH PAL

and Shrimati BALA  DEVI

is registered as a student of the Kurukshetra University

His/Her Registration No. is 23-DSK-630

Class Bachelor of Science in Life Sciences

Kurukshetra-136119
Date: 14-12-2023

AR/DR Sign
(Registration Department)

Prepared By: RAMESH  CHAND Checked By: RAMESH  CHAND

 INSTRUCTIONS
1. The name, father's name and mother's name of the candidate are recorded in
this University according to the names and spellings as shown in this Card.
While corresponding with the University and filling in the Admission Form for
the University examination, candidate must write his/her name as well that of
his/her father/mother, exactly in accordance with the particulars given in this
card.

2. Any mistake in the given particulars should be pointed out within 3 months
of the issue of this card, by the candidate or the principal of the college
concerned and the original card be returned for necessary correction along with
the original certificates, after the expiry of which correction fee of Rs.500/- will
be charged. If original card is not enclosed, fee charged will be Rs.650/-

3. A student once registered with this University is not required to get himself/
herself registered again.


